
SPECIAL

Victoria Government Gazette
No. S 685 Monday 8 December 2025
By Authority of Victorian Government Printer

Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 1983
AMENDING CONDITIONS NO. 5/2025 DETERMINED UNDER SECTION 220D(1)
The Head, Transport for Victoria, the entity established under section 64A of the Transport 

Integration Act 2010, hereby determines, under section 220D(1) of the Transport (Compliance and 
Miscellaneous) Act 1983, the following conditions (the Amending Conditions No. 5/2025) which 
amend the conditions under section 220D(1) of the Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) 
Act 1983 published in Government Gazette No. S 491 on Tuesday 17 September 2024, as amended 
by amending conditions published in Government Gazette No. S 642 on Monday 25 November 2024, 
Government Gazette No. G 52 on Tuesday 24 December 2024, Government Gazette No. S 402  
on Friday 1 August 2025, Government Gazette No. S 407 on Tuesday 5 August 2025, Government 
Gazette No. S 429 on Friday 15 August 2025 and Government Gazette No. S 658 on 28 November 2025.

The Amending Conditions No. 5/2025 take effect on the day they are published in the  
Government Gazette.
Dated 

FIONA ADAMSON 
as delegate of Head, Transport for Victoria

Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) Act 1983
AMENDING CONDITIONS NO. 5/2025 DETERMINED UNDER SECTION 220D(1)
The Conditions under section 220D(1) of the Transport (Compliance and Miscellaneous) 

Act 1983 published in Government Gazette No. S 491 on Tuesday 17 September 2024, as amended 
by amending conditions published in Government Gazette No. S 642 on Monday 25 November 2024, 
Government Gazette No. G 52 on Tuesday 24 December 2024, Government Gazette No. S 402  
on Friday 1 August 2025, Government Gazette No. S 407 on Tuesday 5 August 2025, Government 
Gazette No. S 429 on Friday 15 August 2025 and Government Gazette No. S 658 on 28 November 2025 
are amended as follows:
1.	 In paragraph 4.119 – 

(a)	 for ‘$30’ substitute ‘$20’; and
(b)	 for ‘$24’ substitute ‘$14’.

2.	 In paragraph 4.120 – 
(a)	 for ‘$15’ substitute ‘$10’; and
(b)	 for ‘$12’ substitute ‘$7’.

3.	 After Chapter 10A insert – 

‘Chapter 10B
Applications for Youth myki Smartcards, and restriction on the use  

of Youth myki Smartcards before 1 January 2026
10B.1	 The Conditions in this Chapter apply to applications for Youth myki Smartcards, and provide 

Youth myki Smartcards may not be used to authorise travel before 1 January 2026. 
10B.2	 To the extent that the Conditions in this Chapter are inconsistent with those in any other 

Conditions, the Conditions in this Chapter take precedence.
10B.3	 Applications for Youth myki Smartcards are subject to the following conditions.



2	 S 685	 8 December 2025	 Victoria Government Gazette

10B.4	 The Youth Free Travel entitlement is not available before 1 January 2026, and Youth myki 
Smartcards must not be used on Victoria’s public transport system before that date.

10B.5	 The price of a Youth myki Smartcard is $5.00. 
10B.6	 A Youth myki Smartcard may be issued with $1 Value loaded onto it. If that is the case, the 

$1.00 Value is, and remains, part of the purchase price of the Youth myki Smartcard and 
is, and remains, the property of the Head, Transport for Victoria. The $1 Value may not be 
redeemed for myki Money nor used to obtain an entitlement or purported entitlement to use 
Victoria’s public transport system, and may not be the subject of a refund request. 

10B.7 If a person uses, or attempts to use, a Youth myki Smartcard prior to 1 January 2026 and,  
as a result, the Youth myki Smartcard becomes incapable of use and the person applies for  
a new or replacement Youth myki Smartcard, the person must pay the full price for that new 
or replacement card.’.  



Victoria Government Gazette	   S 685	 8 December 2025	 3

This page was left blank intentionally



4	 S 685	 8 December 2025	 Victoria Government Gazette

The Victoria Government Gazette is published 
by IVE Group Limited with the authority of the 
Government Printer for the State of Victoria

 State of Victoria 2025
This publication is copyright. No part may be 
reproduced by any process except in accordance 
with the provisions of the Copyright Act.
Address all enquiries to the Government Printer 
for the State of Victoria  
Level 2, 1 Macarthur Street 
Melbourne 3002  
Victoria, Australia

	 Retail & 	 Victoria Government Gazette
	 Mail Sales	 Ground Floor, Building 8, 

		  658 Church Street,
		  Richmond 3121
	 Telephone	 03 8523 4601

	 email 	 gazette@ivegroup.com.au 

Price Code A

  How To Order


